
Subject: RE: DARPA Safe Genes Budget Jus�fica�on needs, 4-6-17 - Invita�on to edit

From: Royden Saah <royden.saah@islandconserva�on.org>

Date: 4/18/2017 10:15 AM

To: Joanna Jones <jmjones4@ncsu.edu>, Jason Delborne <jadelbor@ncsu.edu>

CC: "jrgodwinnc@gmail.com" <godwin@ncsu.edu>, Joseph Saah <jrsaah@ncsu.edu>

Hi Joanna,

This is excellent – let me know if I can do any leg work for this or other tasks to get the final touches on the package.  I

appreciate your monumental effort (and that of all involved!) this award represents.

My phone number is .  Don’t hesitate to call, text or email according to priority.

With Gra�tude,

Royden

From: Joanna Jones [mailto:jmjones4@ncsu.edu]

Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2017 10:12 AM

To: Jason Delborne <jadelbor@ncsu.edu>

Cc: Royden Saah <royden.saah@islandconserva�on.org>; jrgodwinnc@gmail.com <godwin@ncsu.edu>; Joseph Saah

<jrsaah@ncsu.edu>

Subject: Re: DARPA Safe Genes Budget Jus�fica�on needs, 4-6-17 - Invita�on to edit

All, I'll call Rory in CNR Pre-Award and let you know what she says.

Joanna

On Tue, Apr 18, 2017 at 10:11 AM, Jason Delborne <jadelbor@ncsu.edu> wrote:

I have never been clear on exactly what is needed from Mahmud, or the source of the holdup/bottleneck. I am
happy to send an email to CNR Pre-Award, but it might be better coming from someone who knows the
paperwork that is needed.

Jason

On Apr 18, 2017, at 10:06 AM, Royden Saah <royden.saah@islandconservation.org> wrote:

Scratch that – I see from Joanna’s email this morning that CNR is working on this.  I will not send anything

to Mahmud.

Could we reach out to CNR and get an es�mated �me of comple�on.  As this is the last bit of info we

need, the en�re award is affected.  I will be glad to assist if desired/necessary. A li�le pressure may be

appropriate at this juncture.

Many Thanks,

Royden

From: Royden Saah

Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2017 9:48 AM
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To: 'Joanna Jones' <jmjones4@ncsu.edu>; jrgodwinnc@gmail.com <godwin@ncsu.edu>

Cc: Joseph Saah <jrsaah@ncsu.edu>; Jason Delborne <jadelbor@ncsu.edu>

Subject: RE: DARPA Safe Genes Budget Jus�fica�on needs, 4-6-17 - Invita�on to edit

Hi All,

As the last item we need is Dr. Farooque’s agreement prior to sending in the budget, I will reach out to

him by email and let him know the importance of this document.  I will also copy you all.

Will send something in 15 minutes unless I hear from you.

Thanks

rs

From: Joanna Jones [mailto:jmjones4@ncsu.edu]

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2017 12:52 PM

To: jrgodwinnc@gmail.com <godwin@ncsu.edu>

Cc: Joseph Saah <jrsaah@ncsu.edu>; Derek Gatlin <derek_gatlin@ncsu.edu>; Jason Delborne

<jadelbor@ncsu.edu>

Subject: Re: DARPA Safe Genes Budget Jus�fica�on needs, 4-6-17 - Invita�on to edit

All, I have made the suggested updates.  The only item still pending is Dr. Farooque's consulting
agreement with ASU - apparently he has to consult as an independent person and not part of
ASU.  The CNR research office is still working out those details, but everything else is finished. 

I plan to send the final email around 1:30 p.m and will copy you all.

Thanks for your help in bringing all this information together!

Cheers,
Joanna

On Fri, Apr 14, 2017 at 9:23 AM, John Godwin <godwin@ncsu.edu> wrote:

Hi Joanna,
    I shared it with Jason (copied here) as his input on the $14040 cost for NCSU item #4 would
be very helpful there.  We used the numbers Jason and his colleagues provided, but not
recalling the calculation that went into those if we had it.  I put in $1170 for 12 participants as
this was the number for Raleigh to Los Angeles for a different workshop.

JG

On Fri, Apr 14, 2017 at 8:08 AM, Joanna Jones <jmjones4@ncsu.edu> wrote:

All, here are my answers to the various questions in blue; red items are pending or need
clarification.

Please take a look and make any changes as needed.

I plan to send this out today.  CNR is reviewing a Keystone consulting agreement so that
might be included, but apparently the ASU consultant might not be affiliated with ASU for
consulting.  In that case, I will notify DARPA that his consulting agreement is still in
progress while we sort it out.
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Thanks!
Joanna

On Fri, Apr 7, 2017 at 8:51 AM, John Godwin (via Google Docs) <drive-shares-
noreply@google.com> wrote:

John Godw in has invited you to edit the follow ing document:

Unknown profile photoHi folks,

Thought it might be helpful to paste those requested pieces of information into a

Google Doc to facil itate work/coordination on it.

John

Google Docs: Create and edit documents online.

Google Inc. 1600 Amphitheatre Parkway , Mountain View, CA 94043, USA

You hav e receiv ed this email because someone shared a document with y ou f rom

Google Docs.

--
*********************************************************************************
John Godwin
Department of Biological Sciences, North Carolina State University
mail:       Dept. Biological Sciences, Box 7614, NCSU,
               Raleigh, NC 27695-7617
Office location: 156 David Clark Laboratories
phone:  919-513-2936,   fax: 919-515-5327
website: http://godwin.wordpress.ncsu.edu/

**********************************************************************************
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